De: Network Engineering. Jose L. Talavera

A: Departamento Administracion

Cc: Cesar Iglesias

Asunto: RE: FACTURA FA2304-0060

Fecha: martes, 18 de julio de 2023 9:23:21

Archivos adjuntos: image001.png

Buenos dias

Vuestros técnicos todavia estan en tareas desde la entrega EO8 a la E28
Cuando acaben, quedara todavia acabar con las tareas E28 a la E33

En cuanto esté todo acabado se os abonara
Saludos

De: Departamento Administracion [mailto:administracionext@tychetools.com]
Enviado el: lunes, 17 de julio de 2023 14:57

CC: Network Engineering. Jose L. Talavera <jl.talavera@net-eng.com>; Cesar Iglesias
<ciglesiasext@tychetools.com>

Asunto: FACTURA FA2304-0060

Hola, buenos dias. Le escribo ya que no hemos recibido el pago correspondiente a la factura que
se adjunta en este documento. Se trata de una factura con fecha de emision del 28/04/2023. Por
favor rogaria nos indicara fecha estimada en la que se producira el pago para poder incorporarla
a nuestra prevision de ingresos.

Un saludo
Enrigue Gémez de Barreda.
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Sebastian Gémez, 5 | Madrid, Spain
Email administracionext@tychetools.com

This message and any attachments are exclusively for the person or entity shown as the recipient(s) and may contain data and / or
confidential information which is subject to professional secrecy or whose disclosure is prohibited under current legislation. Any
disclosure, reproduction or other action in this regard by persons or entities other than the recipient is prohibited. In accordance with
the provisions of Regulation (EU) 2016/679 (RGPD) and LO 3/2018 (LOPDGDD) we inform you that the party responsible for
treatment is TYCHETOOLS, S.L. and you are being contacted either through legitimate interest or in compliance with a contract or
through prior consent of the interested party to send communications about our products and services and in order to comply with
the contractual obligations of the parties or in response to a question raised. Your data will not be disclosed to third parties except
under legal obligation. You can exercise the right to access, rectification, portability, deletion, limitation and opposition by
contacting the person responsible at: C / Sebastian Gomez, 5 6°A, 28026 in Madrid.You can file a claim with the authority
at www.aeped.es. More information on the web www.tychetools.com

Before printing this e-mail or attachments, be sure it is necessary. It is in our hands to protect the environment.


mailto:jl.talavera@net-eng.com
mailto:administracionext@tychetools.com
mailto:/o=ExchangeLabs/ou=Exchange Administrative Group (FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/cn=Recipients/cn=6c9e08bc5df747cc9f32c6b639e6743c-ciglesiasex
https://tychetools.com/
https://tychetools.com/
mailto:administracionext@tychetools.com
https://www.aeped.es/
https://www.tychetools.com/

« 2 TycheTools




